
ORDINANCE NO. 16-23 

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING SECTIONS 102 (CODE 
ADOPTED BY REFERENCE) AND 103 (ADDITIONS AND 
MODIFICATIONS) OF PART 1 (GENERAL PROVISIONS) 
OF ARTICLE 10 (BUILDING CODE ADMINISTRATION) OF 
CHAPTER 7 (PLANNING, DEVELOPMENT AND 
BUILDING) OF THE CODE OF THE CITY OF COLORADO 
SPRINGS 2001, AS AMENDED, AND AMENDING 
PROVISIONS OF THE PIKES PEAK REGIONAL BUILDING 
CODE, 2011 EDITION, FORMERLY ADOPTED BY 
ORDINANCE 11-34, AS AMENDED BY ORDINANCE 13-6 

WHEREAS, El Paso County, the City of Colorado Springs, and other municipalities 
within El Paso County have entered into an intergovernmental agreement to establish the 
Pikes Peak Regional Building Department, which provides joint administration of the 
building construction codes of the participating governments; and 

WHEREAS, the Pikes Peak Regional Building Department and its governing body, the 
Pikes Peak Regional Building Commission have recommended certain changes to the 
Pikes Peak Regional Building Code, 2011 edition, as adopted by City Council through 
Ordinance 11-34, as amended by Ordinance 13-6 (hereinafter the "RBC"); and 

WHEREAS, the recommended changes to the RBC will simplify the construction 
process, take advantage of new code developments, and comply with requirements of 
the State of Colorado including the adoption of plumbing, electrical, and 
elevator/escalator safety codes that have been adopted as rules and regulations of 
Colorado state agencies. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 
COLORADO SPRINGS: 

Section 1. Section 102 (Code Adopted by Reference) of Part 1 (General 

Provisions) of Article 10 (Building Code Administration) of Chapter 7 (Planning, 

Development and Building) of the Code of the City of Colorado Springs 2001, as 

amended, shall be shall be amended, restated and re-ordained in its entirety, as follows: 

7.10.102: CODE ADOPTED BY REFERENCE: 

There is hereby adopted by reference the edition of the Pikes Peak Regional Building 
Code as published by the Pikes Peak Regional Building Department, 2880 International 

1 



Circle,ColorodoSprings,CC 30^10, 2011 edition, osomended,to include: odoptionof 
chopter 13 of the 200^ Internotionol Ivlechonicoi Code-Foel Cil Piping ond Storoge; 
omendments to the Flood PloinCode,omendments to the fee schedule to estoblishoflot 
fee for reroofs, stucco, ond siding,officiolodoption of oppendi^Dto the Regionol gilding 
Code, ondomendments to the Pikes PeokPegionol gliding Code, 2011edition,odopted 
per recommendotion of the Pikes PeokRegionol gilding Deportment in 2016, except os 
provided herein below, including (I) the Colorodo Plombing Code odopted by the 
Colorodo StotePlombing Boord, oppeor ingot3CCR720odopted J^ly 1, 2014, ond 
effective Decembers, 2014, (ii) the Notionol5lectricol Code, 2014 Edition, odopted by 
the Colorodo Stote5lectricolBoord,oppeoringot3CCP710odopted ond effective J^ly 
1,2014, ond (ill) the Americon Society of Ivlechonicol Engineers Sofety Code for Flevotors 
ond 5scolotors,AS^vl5A17.1,2013, including TobleN-1 of Appendi^Nond oil supplements 
thereto, the Sofety Code for Foisting Flevotors ond 5scolotors,ASIvl5A17.3, 2005, ondoii 
supplements thereto, ondtheSofetyStondordforPlotform Lifts ond StoirwoyChoirlifts, 
ASrvl5A13.1,2011,odopted by the Deportment of Lobor ond Employment, Division of Cii 
ond Public Sofety, olong with oil revisions, moditiootions ond exceptions thereto, 
oppeoringin7CCR1101-3, ond effective Jonooryl,2015. Three (3) copies ot the Code 
ore now filed in the Cffice of the City Clerk ond moy be inspected during regolor business 
ho^rs. The Code is being odoptedos if set o^tot length. 

Section 2. Section 103 (Additions ond Ivlodificotions) ot Port 1 (Generol 

Provisions) ot Article 10 (Boilding Code Administrotion) ot Chopter 7 (Plonning, 

Development ond gilding) ot the Code ot the City ot Colorodo Springs 2001, os 

omended,shoii be omended,restoted ond re-ordoined in its entirety to include reference 

to codes odopted by ogencies of the Stote of Colorodo, being the Plumbing Boord,the 

ElectricolBoordondtheDeportmentof Loborond Employment referred to obove, os 

follows: 

7.10^0^ P 5 N A ^ P R O V ^ ^ ^ 

A. The a id ing Code is s^bjectto the foiiowingpenoity provisions: 

R B C l O l ^ . V ^ o ^ ^ Any person vioioting the gliding Code or ony provision of this 
Code shoii be deemed g^iityofomisdemeonor ond ^pon conviction thereof, shoii 
be fined not more thon five hundred doiiors(S500.00), or imprisoned not more thon 
ninety (^O)coiendordoys in the Cityjoii or Coontyjoii, or both. Aseporote offense 
shoii be deemed committed for eoch ond every coiendordoy during which ony 
iiiegoi erection, construction, reconstruction, oiterotion, mointenonce, or ose 
continues, in cose ony boiiding or stroct^re is or is proposed to be erected, 
constructed, reconstructed, oitered or remodeied,osed or mointoined in vioiotion 
of this Code or of ony provision of the Boiiding Code, the City Attorney, in oddition 

2 



to other remedies provided by iow, moy institute on oppropriote ootion tor 
injunction, mondomus or obotement to prevent, enjoin, obote or remove ony 
uniowtui erection, construction, reconstruction, oiterotion, remodeiing, 
mointenonceoruse. 

RBClO^ l ^ A i ^ o r ^ T^ l ^ o ^ A The B i d i n g Cfficiol may impose on 
odmin is t ro t i ve f i ne lnonomoun to fup toone thousonddo l lo rs ( ^ ,000 .00 )onony 
person or entity engoged in ony construction consulting work or construction work 
covered by this Code within the jurisdiction who engoges in this work in violotion of 
ony provisions of this Code. Appeols to this oc t ionmoy be mode os provided for 
eisewhere in this Code. The a i d i n g Cfficiol shoii moke monthly repo r t so tony 
imposed tines to the Regionol Boord ot Review. 

RBC105.2^ 5 ^ ^ ^ ^ All work performed on on emergency bosis, os 
determined by the Building Cff ic iol , tomointoin on existing service or to mointoin 
on existing instollotion, building or structure, where the mointenonce is necessory to 
protect lite or property, shoii not be subject to penolty it opplicotion tor ony 
required permits is mode within seventy-two (72) hours otter commencement o t the 
emergencywork. 

R B C 1 1 2 ^ ^ ^ o ^ ^ ^ r ^ ^ Proof of service of the notice ond order shol lbe 
certified t o o t the time ot service byowr i t tendeclorot ion under penolty ot perjury 
executed by the person effecting service, decloring the time, dote, ond monner in 
which service wos mode. The declorotion, together with ony receipt cord returned 
in ocknowledgment of receipt by certified moil sholl be offi^ed to the copy of the 
notice ond order retoined by the Building Cfficioi. 

RBC112^1. F^r^ O^ A ^ ^ o L Any person entitled to service under section 
RBC112.2.5 of this Code moy oppeol from ony notice ond order to ony oction of 
the Building Cfficiol by filing ot the Cffice of the Building Cfficiol within thirty (30) 
colendor doys from the dote of the service of the order o written oppeol 
contoining: 

1. A hooding in the wordsB^Before the Regionol Boord of Appeols^. 

2. Acop t ion reod ing : Oppeol o f ^ g i v i n g the nomes of oil oppellonts 
porticipoting in the oppeol. 

3. A brief stotement setting forth the legol interest of eoch of the 
oppellonts in the building o r the lond involved in the notice ond order. 

4. Abr iefstotement, in ordinory ond concise longuoge, of the specific 
order or oction protested, together with ony moteriol foots cioimed to 
supportthe contentions of theoppl icont . 

5. Abr ie fs to tement , in ordinory ond concise longuoge, of the relief 
s o u g h t o n d t h e reosons why it i s c l o i m e d t h e protested o r d e r o r o c t i o n 
should be reversed, modified or otherwise set oside. 

3 



6. The signature of oil parties named as oppellonts, and that, in ordinory 
and concise longuoge,of the specific order or action protested,together 
with any material foots claimed to support the contentions of the applicant. 

7. Thesignoture cta i i parties named as appellants, and their ctticiai 
mailing addresses. 

8. The verification (by declaration under penalty of perjury) of all 
appellants os to the truth of the matters stated in the appeal. 

RBC201^^ .F^^y^Cr^^o lF^^^ . No person or entity convicted byacourt having 
competent jurisdiction of a felony, or for civil or criminal fraud, constructive or 
actual, for work related to ony license issued by this jurisdiction, or for work related 
to the building trades in any jurisdiction, shall be grantedalicense or registration, or 
serve as an examinee foracontractor in thisjurisdiction. 

R B C 2 0 1 ^ 0 ^ R ^ ^ o l ^ t ^ F ^ ^ Failure to renewalicense within this forty-five (45) 
calendar day period after the expiration dote of the license will require payment of 
afifty percent (50^)penalty if renewed wlthinninety(^0)calendardays of the 
expiration dote. All requests for renewals after ninety (^0) calendar days from the 
expiration date shall require re-application, examination, evaluation by the 
respective Committee, and approval by the Boord of Review. 

Appendix 13 

R. Investigation Fee: Work WithoutARermit. 

^v^^ot^r^ .Whenever any work for whichapermit is required by this Code has 
been commenced without first obtaining said permit,aspecial investigation shall 
be made beforeapermit may be issued for such work. 

An investigation fee, in addition to the permit fee, shall be collected whether 
or notapermit is then or subsequently issued.The investigation fee shall be equal to 
twice the amount of the permit fee that would be required by this Code ifapermit 
were issued. The payment of such an investigation fee shall not exempt any person 
from compliance with any provisions ofthis Code norfrom any prescribed by law. 

O. Re-inspection Fees: 

A re-inspectionfee may be assessed foreachinspectionor re-inspection when 
such portion of work for which inspection is requested is not complete, when 
corrections required byoprevious inspection have not been mode,or when an 
additionol inspection is required for alterations made aftercompletion of initial 
inspection. 

This is not to be interpreted as requiringre-inspectionfeesthefirsttimeajob is 
rejected for failure to comply with the requirements of the technical codes, but as 

4 



controlling the proctice of requesting inspections before the job is reody for such 
on inspection or re-inspection. 

Re-inspection fees may be assessed when the permit cord is not properly posted on 
the work site, the approved plans ore not reod i lyava i lab le to the inspector , fo r 
failure to provide access on the dote tor which inspection is requested, or tor 
deviating from plans requiring the approval o f the Building Cfficial. 

in instances where re-inspection tees have been assessed, no additional inspection 
ot the work will be performed until such tees hove been paid. 

B. The Building Code is subjectto the following additions and modifications: 

RBC108.2.Addthefol lowingtotheend: 

A fee schedule shall be established by resolution o f the City Council. 

RBC302.4.1. Section 202.1. Add the following definitions: 

C o ^ o ^ o ^ ^ o o ^ roofing isaroof ing product composed of natural wood 
fibers and falls within the Underwriters Laboratories (UL) category of formed 
roofing. 

^ o ^ ^ o o ^ roofing products are roofing materials that are defined as ^wood 
shakes^, ^wood shingles^, or ^wood shakes ond shingles, fire retordont 
(treated^.These materials are cellulose based wood products that include 
non-treated and pressure impregnation by the full-cell vacuum-pressure 
process with fireretordont chemicals. 

RBC302.4.24 Insert a new section as follows: 

Section RBC302.4.24.1. Section 1505.1 Add the following: 

All buildings shall have a minimum roof covering of Class B. 

EXCEPTION: Buildings containing twenty percent (20%) or more of a Group R 
fire area shall have a minimum roof covering of Class A excluding solid wood 
roofing products. 

These requirements shall also apply when completely recovering or 
replacing a roof covering in accordance with Section 1510 of the 
International Building Code, 2009 Edition, and Section RBC 104.4 of the 
Building Code. 

RBC302.4.24.2 Table 1505.1. Delete. 

RBC303.4.1. Section R202. Add the following definitions: 

5 



Composition Wood roofing is a roofing product composed of natural wood 
fibers and falls within the Underwriters Laboratories (UL) category of formed 
roofing. 

Solid Wood roofing products are roofing materials that are defined as "wood 
shakes", "wood shingles", or "wood shakes and shingles, fire-retardant 
(treated)", These materials are cellulose based wood products that include 
non-treated and pressure impregnation by the full-cell vacuum-pressure 
process with fire retardant chemicals, 

RBC303.4.60. Insert a new section as follows: 

Section RBC303.4.60.1. Section R902.1. Amend the section as follows: 

Delete the second sentence and replace with the following: 

One- and two-family dwellings shall have a minimum roof covering of Class 
A excluding solid wood roofing products. Accessory structures shall have a 
minimum roof covering of Class B. 

In the third sentence, delete "Classes A, B, and C" and replace with "Classes 
A and B". 

Add the following to the end of the paragraph: 

These requirements shall also apply when completely recovering or 
replacing a roof covering in accordance with Section R907 of the 
International Residential Code, 2009 Edition and Section RBC 104.4 of the 
Building Code. 

RBC306.2. Delete this section and insert a new section as follows: 

Section RBC 306.2. CODE ADOPTED BY REFERENCE. There is hereby adopted 
by reference the Colorado Plumbing Code adopted by the Department of 
Regulatory Agencies, Division of Professions and Occupations, Colorado 
State Plumbing Board, 1560 Broadway, Suite 1350, Denver Colorado, 80202, 
along with all revisions, modifications and exceptions thereto made by such 
board, appearing at 3 CCR 720, adopted July 1, 2014, and effective 
December 15, 2014. Three copies of the Code are now filed in the office of 
the Office of the City Clerk and in the Office of the Regional Building Official 
and may be inspected during regular business hours. The code is being 
adopted in its entirety. 

RBC307.2. Delete this section and insert a new section as follows: 

6 



Section RBC 307.2. CODES ADOPTED BY REFERENCE. There is hereby 
adopted by reference National Electrical Code, 2014 Edition, adopted by 
the Department of Regulatory Agencies, Division of Professions and 
Occupations, Colorado State Electrical Board, 1560 Broadway, Suite 1350, 
Denver Colorado, 80202, appearing at 3 CCR 710 adopted and effective 
July 1, 2014. Three copies of the Code are now filed in the Office of the City 
Clerk and in the office of the Regional Building Official and may be 
inspected during regular business hours. The code is being adopted in its 
entirety. 

RBC 310.3. Delete this section and insert a new section as follows: 

Section RBC 310.3. CODES ADOPTED BY REFERENCE. There is hereby 
adopted by reference American Society of Mechanical Engineers Safety 
Code for Elevators and Escalators, ASME A l 7.1, 2013, including Table N-l of 
Appendix N and all supplements thereto; the Safety Code for Existing 
Elevators and Escalators, ASME A17.3, 2005, and all supplements thereto, 
and the Safety Standard for Platform Lifts and Stairway Chairlifts, ASME A18.1, 
2011, adopted by the Department of Labor and Employment, Division of Oil 
and Public Safety, 633 17 t h Street, Suite 500, Denver Colorado, 80202, along 
with all revisions, modifications and exceptions thereto, appearing in 7 CCR 
1101-8, and effective January 1, 2015. Three copies of these Codes are now 
filed in the Office of the City Clerk and in the Office of the Regional Building 
Official and may be inspected during regular business hours. The codes are 
being adopted in their entirety. 

RBC313.6. This section is subject to the additions, modifications, and/or deletions 
set forth in City Code 7.8.102. 

RBC313.17.1. This section is subject to the additions, modifications, and/or deletions 
set forth in City Code 7.8.102. 

RBC313.17.2. This section is subject to the additions, modifications, and/or deletions 
set forth in City Code 7.8.102. 

RBC 313.18.5. This section is subject to the additions modifications, and/or deletions 
set forth in City Code 7.8.102. 

Section 3. The 2016 amendments to the Pikes Peak Regional Building Code, 2011 

edition, referred to above in Section 1 of this ordinance, by recommendation of the Pikes 

Peak Regional Building Department are hereby amended, adopted, and/or deleted, as 

indicated, stated and/or restated, in their entirety, as follows: 

7 



105,2,1 Construction ond instoiiotions. Permits shoii not be required for the foiiowing: 

^ Cne-s to ry ,de toched,occesso^^^c t^e^os defined by the internotionoi 

Residentioi Code, provided thot the f ioororeo does not exceed two hundred (200) 
squorefeet, 

2. Cne-story, detoched, unheoted buiidings used tor weother protection, 
storoge or simiiorcommercioi uses provided thot the f ioororeo does not exceed 
one hundred-twenty (120)squorefeet, 

3. Fences not more thon seven (7) feet in height, 

4. Cii derricks, fiogpoies ond privoteontennos, 

5. Petoiningwoiis not more thonfour(4) feet in height meosured from the iower 
g r o d e t o t h e u p p e r g r o d e , un iesssuppor t i ngosu rcho rge t romos t ruc tu reo ro 
grodes iopegreoter thon two (2) units hori^ontoi to one ( l )vert icoi or impounding 
Ciossi,ii, or iii-A liquids, 

^ Wotertonks supported directly upon grode if the copocity does not exceed 
tivethousond (5,000) goiions ond the rot ioot height to diometer or width does not 
exceed two (2) to one (1), 

7. Woter tonks of ony si^e ond ony occessory equipment under the direct 
control ofout i l i ty purveyor locoted completely below grode, 

8. Privotesidewolks,drivewoys, ond plotforms supported directly upon grode, 
Any steps creoted must comply with the opplicoble provisions o f the Building Code, 

^ Detoched decks in conjunction with one ond two-fomily dweiiings not 
exceeding 200 squoreteet in o reothot ore not more thon thirty (30) inches obove 
g r o d e o t ony point within thirty six (36) inches ot the deck perimeter ond do not 
serve the required egress door, 

^0. Replocement of ony windows or tixed globing uniess the rough opening 
dimensions ore modified, Peplocement of ony window required os on emergency 
escope ond rescue opening ond sotety globing required due to o ho^ordous 
iocotlon must complywith the opplicoble provisions o f the Building Code, 

^ Pointing, popering,ti i ing,corpeting,cobinets, counter tops ond simiior finish 
work, 

^ Swimming poois occessory to one- ond two-fomily dweiiings ond not 
reguiotedbythisCode, 

^ Repoirs to roofing ond^or siding when therepo l r constitutes less thon one 
hundred (100) squore feet, 

^ Swings ond other pioyground equipment, 

^5. Window ownings supported by on exterior woii which do not project more 
thon fifty-four (54) inches from the exterior woii ond do not require odditionoi 
support of one-ond two-fomiiy dweiiings ond occessory structures, 

^ Ivlovoble coses, counters, ond portitions not over five (5) feet nine (9) inches 
in height, 

^ Hydroulic flood-control structures, 

^ Pedestrion ond vehiculor bridges not directly serving or constructed os port 
ofobui id ing, 

The removoi ond reinstoiiotion of piumbing fixtures provided the work does 

8 



not involve the replacement or rearrangement of drain, waste, vent or water pipes; 
20. Portable heating, ventilating or cooling units; 
21. Evaporative coolers in connection with one- and two-family dwellings, 
where no structural elements or components are modified. 
22. Agricultural buildings and agricultural structures located in the County, as 
defined by the El Paso County Land Development Code. 
23. Non-public, non-residential buildings located in the A-35 District in the 
County, as defined by the El Paso County Land Development Code. 

R8C 106.1 G5N5RALR50UIR2rvl5N7S. 

Construction documents shoii be reviewed ond opproved by the Building Cfficiol prior 
to the issuonceofopermit for the proposed work. All opplicotionsforopermit shoii be 
occomponied by one completesetof construction documents whichsholl include 
orchitecturol, structured plumbing, mechonicol ond electricol plons ond detoils os 
opplicoble. Construction documents shoii be of sufficient ciority to indicote the scope 
of the work proposed ond show in detoil thot It wiiiconform to the provisions of this 
Code ond oil relevont lows, ordinonces, rules, ond reguiotions. 

RBC110.1.2 Chonges in Use. No chonge shoii be mode in the chorocter ot 
occuponcy or use ot ony building thot would pioce the building in o different 
occuponcyclossificotion, unless the building is mode to comply with the requirements 
ofthisCode.Achongeinusetoousethotcousesonincreoseintheoccupontlood 
of greoterthon ten percent (10%) of the originol use shoii require complionce with the 
requirements of this Code the some os required byochonge to onother occuponcy 
ciossificotion.Anew certificote of occuponcy shoii be issued for oil chonges in use os 
provided herein. 

5xception:Anew certificote of occuponcy is not required when the chonge of use is 
fromoGroupBto Group Ivl occuponcy or vice verso provided the resulting occupont 
lood does not exceed fifty (50) occuponts. 

RBC 111.4.1 Technical Committee. The Technical Committee shall review all 
appeals with power and authority to interpret and recommend minor variances from 
this Code. The Technical Committee shall be composed of seven (7) members as 
follows: 

1. Architect licensed by the State of Colorado 
2. Professional Engineer licensed by the State of Colorado (civil - structural) 
3. Building Contractor A, B or C 
4. Mechanical Contractor A 

9 



5. Eiectricol Contractor licensed by the State ot Colorado 

^ Master Plumber licensed by the State ot Colorado 

7. B i d i n g C o n t r a 

RBCm.4.2 Licensing Committee. The Licensing Committee shall be primarily 
responsible tor testing and reviewing oil oppliconts tor licenses and the pertormonceot 
work required under the Commercial Building Code, the Residential Building Code, the 
Existing Building Cade, the Mechanical Cede, the Fuel Gas Cade, the Energy 
Conservation Cade, theManutactured Building Code ond rev iewo topp l i can ts tor 
registration under the Electrical ond Plumbing Codes as well as the pertormonceot 
work under the Elevator and Escalator Satety Code. The Licensing Committee shall be 
composed ot seven (7) members as tallows: 

1. Architect licensed by the State ot Colorado 

2. Protessional Engineer licensed by the State otColorado (mechanical) or 

Mechanical Contractors 

3. Building Contractors 

4. Contractor (building or mechanical) 

5. Building ContractorC 

^ Ctt icerotat inancial institution 

7. Citizen at Large 

RBC 201.6.2.3 Rrovisionol Licensed When approved by the B i d i n g Cfficiol, o 
provisionol license subject to the oppropriotelimitotionsmoy be issued for the purpose 
ot demonstrating experience. The license shoii be limited to six (6) months ond subject 
tore leosebytheBoordofReview. 

RBC 201.6.2.4 issuonce Fee. it, in the opinion ot the Boord ot Review, otter 
recommendotion by the opproprlote Advisory Committee, the oppl lcont foro l lcense 
is quoiified by knowledge, training, ond experience to do the type of work envisioned 
under the specific controctor^slicenseopplled for, it sholl direct the Building Cfficiol to 
i ssue theopp l l con to license upon p o y m e n t o t t h e o n n u o l t e e p r e s c r i b e d InToble 
RBC202.6 of this Code, ond upon providing evidence of the required insurance. 5och 
onnuol tee shoii be in oddition to the oppiicotion tee. As concerns evidence ot 
knowledge, the successful possingotexominotions required by this jurisdiction shoii be 
deemed pr imofocie evidence of the requisite knowledge of contractor^sexominee. 
Oeterminotion ond evoluotion of experience ond training shoii be occomplished by 
the respective Committees under guidelines set forth from time to time by the Building 
Cfficiol. 

to 



RBC 303.4.8 Section R305.1 Minimum height. Add the following after the first 
sentence: 

Projections beyond the finished ceiling shall not extend below 6 feet, 8 inches 
(2,032 mm). 

Add the following exception: 

3. In finished basements, the required ceiling height may be reduced to 6 feet, 

8 inches (2,032 mm) under furred-down beams, pipes and ducts up to but not 
exceeding a width of 8 feet (2,438.4 mm). 

RBC 303.4.63 Section R905.2.8.3 Other flashing. Add the following to the end of the 
last sentence: 

"or other approved methods." 

(RBC 306.3 and 306.4 deleted) 

RBC 310.4 ADDITIONS AND MODIFICATIONS. The adopted Codes are subject to the 
following additions and modifications: 

RBC 310.4.1 ASME A17.1, Section 5.8 SHIPBOARD ELEVATORS. Delete. 

RBC 310.4.2 ASME A17.1, Section 5.9 MINE ELEVATORS. Delete. 

RBC 310.4.3 ASME A17.1, Section 5.10 ELEVATORS USED FOR CONSTRUCTION. Delete. 

RBC 310.4.4 ASME A17.1, Section 8.6.5.15 Periodic Test Requirements: Category 3. 
Delete. 

RBC 310.4.5 ASME A17.1, Section 8.11.1.1.2 Periodic Tests. Delete subsection (a) and 
replace with the following: 

11 



(b^ The tests referred to osCotegorylondCotegory5inTobieN-l ,ot Appendix 
N,otA3ivl5A17.1ondA13.1,shoii be performed byoconveyoncecontroctor 
on oil exiting conveyonces ot frequencies no greoter thon 1 yeor tor 
Cotegorylond5yeors for Cotegory 5.Aconveyonce inspector shoii witness 
the pertormonceot the foiiowing test: Cotegoryl testotieostevery5yeors 
tor: 

^ 5ievotor 
^ PiotformOft 
^ Personnel Hoist 
( ^ D^mbwoiter 

Deietesobsection^ondrepioce with the foiiowing: 
(b^ The owner or the owners outhorized ogent shoii hove oiiot the tests required 

by3ections3.11.2,3.11.3,3.11.4,ond3.11.5cond^ctedbyoiicensedeievotor 
controctor.Awritten document shoii be provided to the Boiiding Deportment 
within thirty (30) coiendordoys with the res îts of s^ch tests. 

Exception: 5scoiotors ond moving woiks shoii hove the CotegorylPeriodic 
Testes per Appendix N,TobieN-l,witnessed by the Boiiding Deportment or 
its outhorized ogent. 

R8C310.4.6 A3M5A17.1,Section 3.11.1.3 Periodic inspection ondTest Frequency. 
The frequency of periodic inspections ond tests shoii be in occordonce with Appendix 
N,Tobie^ l . 

RBC310.4.7 ASM5A17.1,Section 3.11.5.3Shipboord5ievotors.Deiete. 

R8C310.4.3 ASM5A17.1,Section 3.11.5.135ievotors0sedforConstr^ction.Deiete. 

RBC310.4.9 AStvl5A17.1,AppendixNTobieN-l.Recommended inspections ond 
test intervoisin"ivlonths".Deiete the foiiowing items from the Tobie: 

3.11.5.2. Privote Residence 5ievotors. 
3.11.5.3.Shipboord5ievotors. 
3.11.5.13. 5ievotors0sed for Construction. 

R5C310.4.10 ASivl5 A17.3,Section 1.2. Appiicotionot Code: Add thetoiiowing 
exceptions otterthe second porogroph: 

Exceptions: 
( ^ Aii conveyonces prior to Joiyl,2003, ore exempt from complying with ASM5 

A17.3,oniess the foiiowing conditions exist: 
(ô ) S^bstontioioiterotionofoconveyonce;or 
(b^ An eievotorpresentsomoterioirisk.Arisk to pobiic sofety os determined by 

the Authority Hoving Jurisdiction. 
( ^ rvloterioiriskreiotedtofirefighter service is not present except if ony of the 

toiiowing conditions exist: 

t2 



^ The elevator c o r n e r 
(b^ The elevator trover less than 75 teet above or below the emergency 

personnel access or 
(b) The building Is equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system In 

accordance with NFRA18, Any elevator thot does not meet any of the 
conditions listed above must comply with the Firefighters^ service 
requlrementsasdescrlbed In the currently adopted version of ASM5A17,!, 
byJanuary 1,2015, 

^ DoorRestrlctors, 
(b^ Door restrlctors shall be Installed ond operational by Januaryl,2012, on all 

elevators Installed on or after January 1,1990, and before January 1,2008; 
(b^ Door restrlctors shall be Installed and operational prior to the next Issuance 

ofthe Certificate of Operation on all elevators Installed on or after January 
1,2008; 

(b^ Upon review of additional Information, the Authority Having Jurisdiction 
may determine whether door restrlctors shall be required on any elevator 
Installed prlorto January 1,1990, 

^ Ahydraullc elevator thot hosahydraullc cylinder burled In the ground and Is 
not provided wlthasafety bulkhead, will be allowed to continue operation 
after January 1, 2012, If the conveyance owner completes one ot the 
following actions In conformance with ASMFA17,8-2008: 

(a) The hydraulic cylinder shall be provided with a safety bulkhead In 
accordance with ASM5A17,l;or 

(b^ The elevator shall be provided with cor safeties conforming to ASM5A17,!, 
Section 8,17,1, and guide rolls, guide roll supports, and fastenings 
conforming to ASMFA17,!,Section 8,28,l,or 

(b^ The elevator shall be provided wlthaplungergrlpper that shall grip the 
plunger when the applicable maximum governor tripping speed Is 
achieved per ASM5A17,!,Section 8,17,8, 

RBC810,411 ASM5A17,8,Sectlonl,4, Definitions, Addthe following definitions: 
Material Risk, Arlsk to public safety as determined by the Authority Having Jurisdiction, 
Substantial Alteration, An alteration that Includes: 

(b^ The change In type of service of an elevator; or 
(b^ The change In type of operation control or motion control on an elevator; or 
(b^ The replacement ofacontroller In conjunction with another alteration on an 

electric elevator, 

RBC 312.3.6 Authority to Act. The Building Official shall have the authority to 
determine or otherwise act upon the assignment of or a change to a numeric address, 
or any matter related thereto. 

13 



Sect ions The toiiowingpenoity provisions set torth in the 2011 Regions B i d i n g 

Code, incompiioncewithC.R.S.^31-16-204, ore reodoptedossettor thbeiow: 

RBC101.8 ViCbATiCNS. Any person vioioting the Building Code or ony provision ot this 
Code shoii be deemed guilty otomisdemeonor ond upon conviction thereof, shoii be 
fined not more thon five hundred dollors (^500.00), or imprisoned not more thon ninety 
(90) colendordoys in the city joll or county joil, or both. A seporote offense shoii be 
deemed committed tor eooh ond every ooiendor doy during which ony illegoi 
erection, construction, reconstruction, oiterotion, mointenonce, or use continues, in 
cose ony building or structure is or is proposed to be erected, constructed, 
reconstructed, oltered or remodeled, used or mointoined in vlolotion of this Code or of 
ony provision ot the BuildingCode, the city ottorney, i n o d d i t i o n t o other remedies 
provided by iow, moy institute on oppropriote oction tor injunction, mondomus or 
obotement to prevent ,enjo in,obote or remove ony unlowful erection, construction, 
reconstruction, oiterotion, remodeling, mointenonce or use. 

RBC103.12 AUTHCRITYTC IMRC55 A FIN5. The Building Ctticlol may impose on 
odminlstrotive tine in on o m o u n t o t u p t o o n e t h o u s o n d dollors (^1,000.00) on ony 
person or entity engoged in ony construction consulting work or construction work 
covered by this Code within the Jurisdiction who engoges in this work in violotionot ony 
provisions ot this Code. Appeois to this oct ionmoy be mode os provided tor elsewhere 
in this Code. The Building Ctticiolsholl moke monthly reports ot ony imposed tines to the 
RegionolBoordot Review. 

emergency Work. Aii work performed on on emergency bosis, os 
determined by fhe B i d i n g 
existing instoiiotion, buiiding or structure, where the mointenonce is necessory to 
protect iife or property, shoii not be subject to penoity if oppiicotion for ony required 
permits is mode within seventy-two (72) hours offer commencement of the emergency 
work. 

RBC112.2.5.3 Proof of Service. Proof of service of the notice ond order shoii be certified 
t o o t the time of service byowr i t tendeciorot ion under penoity of perjury executed by 
the person effecting service, decioring the time, dote, ondmonner in which service 
wos mode. The deciorotion, together with ony receipt cord returned in 
ocknowiedgment of receipt by certified moii shoii be offixed to the copy of the notice 
ond order retoined by the Building Cfficioi. 

RBC112.3.1 Form of Appeol. Any person entitled to service under Section RBCH2.2.5 of 
this Code moy oppeol from ony notice ond order to ony octlon of the Building Cfficiol 

t 4 



by fiiingot the Office of the BuiidingOfficioi within thirty (30) coiendordoys from the 
dote ofthe service of the orderowrittenoppeoicontoining: 

^ A heoding in the words: "Before the RegionoiBoord of Appeois". 
2. Acoptionreoding:"Appeoiof ,"givingthenomesofoiioppeiionts 
porticipotingintheoppeoi. 
^ A brief stotement setting forth the iegoi interest of eochot the oppeiionts in 
the buiidingortheiond involved in the notice ond order. 
^ A brief stotement, in ordinory ond concise ionguoge, of the specific order or 
oofion protested, together with ony moterioi foots cioimed to support the 
contentions oftheoppiicont. 
5. A brief stotement, in ordinory ond concise ionguoge, ofthereiief sought ond 
the reosons why it is cioimed the protested orderoroct ionshouidbe reversed, 
modified or otherwise set oside. 
^ The signoture of oiiportiesnomed os oppeiionts, ond thot, in ordinory ond 
concise ionguoge, of thespecific order or oction protested, together with ony 
moterioi foots cioimed to supportthe contentions oftheoppiicont. 
7. Thesignotureof oiiportiesnomedosoppeiionts,ondtheirofficioimoiiing 
oddresses. 
^ The verificotion (by deciorotion under penoity of perjury) of oii oppeiionts os 
tothetruthofthemottersstotedintheoppeoi. 

Felony,Criminol Fraud. No person or entity convicted byocourthoving 
competent jurisdiction ototeiony,or tor civii or criminoitroud, constructive or octuoi, tor 
work rented to ony license issued by this 
trades in onyjurisdiction, shoii be granted o license or registration, or serve os on 
exomineetorocontroctor in this jurisdiction. 

201.10.4 Renewoi with Fees.Foiiure to renewoiicense within this torty-tive(45)coiendor 
doy period otter the expirotion dote ot the license wiii require poyment ot o titty 
percent (50%) penoity it renewed within ninety (90) coiendordoysot the expirotion 
dote. Aii requests tor renewois otter ninety (90) coiendordoystrom the expirotion dote 
shoii require re-oppiicotion,exominotion,evoiuotion by the respective Committee, ond 
opprovoi by the Boordot Review. 

APPENDIX B 

P. Investigation Fee: Work without a Permit. 

Investigation. Whenever any work for which a permit is required by this Code 
has been commenced without first obtaining said permit, a special 

15 



investigotion shoii be mode betoreopermitmoy be issued tor soch work. 

Fee. Aninvestigotiontee, inoddi t iontothe permit tee, shoiibecoiiected 
whether or notopermit is then or subsequently issued.The investigotion tee 
shoii be eq^oi to twice the omo^ntot the permit tee thot wo^id be required 
by this Code i topermit were issoed.The poymentotsoch on investigotion 
tee shoii not exempt ony person tromoompiionoe with ony provisions ot this 
Code nor trom ony prescribed by iow. 

o. Re-inspection Fees: 

Are-inspection tee moy be ossesseb tor eooh inspection or re-inspection 
when s^ch portion ot work tor which inspection is requested is not compiete, 
when corrections required byoprevio^s inspection hove not been mode, or 
when on obbitionoi inspection is required tor oiterotions mobe otter 
compietionotinitioi inspection. 

This is notto be interpreted os requiring re-inspection tees the tirsttimeojob is 
rejected tor toii^re to compiy with the requirements ot the technicoi codes, 
b^toscontroiiing the proctice ot requesting inspectionsbetorethejob is 
reody tor s^ch on inspection or re-inspection. 

Re-inspectionteesmoy beossessed whenthe permitcord isnotproperiy 
posted on the work site, the opprovedpions ore not reodiiy ovoiiobie to the 
inspector, tor toii^reto provide occess on the dotetorwhichinspectionis 
requested, or tor deviotingtrompions requiring the opprovoiot the a id ing 
Ctticioi. 

in instonces where re-inspection tees hove been ossessed, no odditionoi 
inspection ot the work wiii be performed ontiis^ch tees hove been poid. 

Sections This ordinance shoii be in toiitorce ond ettect otter its tinoi adoption 

and publication as provided by Charter. 

Sections Cooncii deems it appropriate that this ordinance be published in t^ii 

and thatthis ordinance be avaiiabie tor inspection and acquisition in the otticeotthe City 

Cierk. 

introduced, read, passed ontirst reading and ordered published this 23^ dayot 

Febr^ary,2016. 

^no^oossed: March 8, 2016 ^ 
C 

t6 



Mayor's Action: 

1% Approved: m<u«*- 'o, ZotL 
• Disapproved: , based on the following objections: 

Council Action After Disapproval: 

• Council did not act to override the Mayor's veto. 
• Finally adopted on a vote of , on . 
• Council action on failed to override the Mayor's veto. 

^ ^ ^ ^ Council Roden t 
A775^ 

^ ^ ^ ^ 
^ 

^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ 
SorahB.Johnson, C ^ ^ i e ^ ^ ^ ^ B ^ ^ 

17 



I HEREBY CERTIFY, that the foregoing ordinance entitled "AN ORDINANCE 

AMENDING SECTIONS 102 (CODE ADOPTED BY REFERENCE) AND 103 

(ADDITIONS AND MODIFICATIONS) OF PART 1 (GENERAL PROVISIONS) OF 

ARTICLE 10 (BUILDING CODE ADMINISTRATION) OF CHAPTER 7 (PLANNING. 

DEVELOPMENT AND BUILDING) OF THE CODE OF THE CITY OF COLORADO 

SPRINGS 2001, AS AMENDED. AND AMENDING PROVISIONS OF THE PIKES 

PEAK REGIONAL BUILDING CODE. 2011 EDITION. FORMERLY ADOPTED BY 

ORDINANCE 11-34. AS AMENDED BY ORDINANCE 13-6" was introduced and read 

at a regular meeting of the City Council of the City of Colorado Springs, held on 

February 23, 2016; that said ordinance was finally passed at a regular meeting of the 

City Council of said City, held on the 8 t h day of March, 2016, and that the same was 

published in full, in accordance with Section 3-80 of Article III of the Charter, in the 

Transcript, a newspaper published and in general circulation in said City, at least ten 

days before its passage. 

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereunto set my hand and affixed the seal of the 

City, this 10 t h day of March, 2016. # ^ o " % % 
# rr%.— 

1 s t Publication Date: February 26, 2016 
2 n d Publication Date: March 16, 2016 

Effective Date: March 21, 2016 Initial: 5-.&3 
City Clerk 


